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Abstract 

 

A priori knowledge in the Kantian 
sense is characterized as being 
independent from experience, insofar 
as it is necessary for the possibility of 
experience in general. This notably 
includes the fundamental principles of 
geometry and physics. With scientific 
changes such as non-Euclidean 
geometry and relativistic physics, 
there arose the question whether the 
Kantian a priori ought to be revised in 
the light of the best current theories or 
replaced by pragmatic considerations 
or conventions. This talk will offer a 
review of the progressive 
relativization of the Kantian a priori 
from the Marburg School of neo-
Kantianism to Hans Reichenbach’s 
early work. It will then use Pap’s 
taxonomy to differentiate among 
these early relativizing strategies and 
to contrast them with attempts to 
relativize the Kantian a priori in 
contemporary philosophy of science. 
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